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The competition in the advertising industry today is very tight due to the choice of media in advertise is 

increasing with their respective advantages. To face this competition, the press advertising cannot rely on sales 

ordinarily but also a more approach to consumers. In this case, the brand which has an interest over promotion 

market. Thus, this study aims to determine the effective effect on influence of customer satisfaction with 
customer loyalty and the performance of marketing organizations over outdoor advertising companies. This 

research uses quantitative research methods to obtain the result. Here, we distribute a document set of 

questionnaires to collect data from respondents. The manager of advertising agency has interviewed because 

they are consultants for brands to carry out promotional strategies in advertising in Jakarta, Indonesia. In this 

research, we obtain the interviewed respondent around 37 people with positions equivalent to media Manager or 

Media Director in several advertising agencies. Furthermore, this research is processed using the SmartPLS 

application to obtain the result. The results of this study indicate that customer satisfaction has a significant 

effect on customer loyalty and organizational performance for the total effect obtained from organizational 

performance from the application of customer satisfaction by 34.3% which means significant, because that 

customer satisfaction must always be considered by the company. 
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1. INTRODUCTION 

Companies in the current era of globalization are required 
to be able to create good products if they want to survive 

in the current business competition [1]. The number of 

new competitors that have sprung up with new and 
different marketing strategies will make the competition 

even tighter and heated [2]. A company can be a winner 

in a business competition if the company can attract as 

many consumers and of course this will provide great 
benefits for the company, to support this competition 

requires the right communication tools from the brand to 

its consumers in this case, namely external 
communication, namely advertising and promotion [3]. 

The development of consumer-brand relationships is 

currently the focus of branding theory in recent years, and 
brands act as a mechanism to engage buyers and sellers in 

long-term brand-consumer relationships Algesheimer [4]. 

The main input of this relationship is the experience of a 

brand, and the main output of this relationship is brand - 
*Email Address: adhitya.made@gmail.com 

loyalty, if consumers have a good experience with a 

particular brand, customer satisfaction will be formed for 
a brand and will increase loyalty to that brand [5, 6]. In 

terms of promoting a product of a brand to consumers, 

proper advertising is needed [7]. The three factors that 
influence consumer behavior, the first factor is stimuli 

[8]. Stimuli indicate the acceptance of information by 

consumers and the process of providing information 

occurs when consumers evaluate information from 
advertising and their own experiences, the second factor 

is personal consumer characteristics, including 

personality, lifestyle and benefits, for the third factor, 
namely consumer response, namely the final result of 

consumer decisions. Because of these three things, giving 

stimuli to consumers of a brand is important, and the 
choice of advertising media is also very influential on the 

goals the brand wants to achieve, brand owners must 

ensure that promotions carried out through advertising 

media can be reached and seen by consumers, if This can 
be achieved by consumers, the level of customer 
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satisfaction will be achieved, and by achieving customer 

satisfaction, customers will no longer hesitate to promote 

their products through these advertising media [9, 10]. 
One of the advertising media that is still the choice of 

advertisers i.e. outdoor advertising. Here, outdoor 

advertising is a method for publishing business products 
and services through billboards, bus benches, taxis, 

vehicles, and several other methods, this serves to 

promote products in specific geographic areas, and this 
method is one of the oldest forms of advertising ever 

applied from ancient Rome and Greece [11]. The 

popularity of outdoor advertising also comes at a time 

when consumers spend less time at home where outdoor 
media is consumed more frequently. Today's consumers 

often travel and spend time and activities outside the 

home, such as eating out, shopping and doing many other 
things outside the house with their families [12]. Outdoor 

media includes outdoor advertising in several forms such 

as posters, road billboards, transit advertisements, placed 

on public and private transport vehicles and at bus 
terminals, train stations, buses and air. It is believed that 

man spends a third of his life outdoors as well as with the 

ever-growing development of highways, the increase in 
circulating cars, the spread of the population to the 

suburbs and the greater mobility of society. By using this 

opportunity, the advertising messages carried by this 
outdoor advertising media is getting bigger [13]. Because 

outdoor advertising is in the public area, outdoor 

advertising media definitely reaches the desired target 

community because it cannot be turned off or removed, 
people will be exposed to these advertisements whether 

they like it or not, in this case, outdoor advertising has 

advantages and a large audience [14]. Want to be caught, 
the message that is conveyed works based on the 

principle of advertising, namely frequency because some 

of the messages remain in the same place for a month or 

more, passers-by see the same message several times, 
advertising media placed in a certain place can direct 

people to the destination to be determined, and can reach 

targets in a more efficient way, for brands advertising 
through outdoor media is a very good addition when 

combined with other media [15]. As an advertising 

service provider, outdoor media needs to pay attention to 
the needs and satisfaction of its customers, in this case, 

the customer in question is brand holders who use media 

services to promote their products, to maintain customer 

satisfaction and loyalty today is something that is very 
complicated and continues to dynamically develop from 

time to time [16]. 

A several previous studies related to improving 
marketing performance conducted research on the 

implementation of appropriate customer satisfaction 

which can improve marketing performance in the banking 
industry in Kenya [17, 18] a customer satisfaction and 

customer loyalty to company business performance in 

several companies in America [19]. The benefits of 

implementing customer loyalty in food companies in 

Nigeria on marketing performance regarding the benefits 

of implementing customer satisfaction and loyalty on 

marketing performance [20]. However, until now, 
throughout the existing literature studies, no one has 

conducted research on the application, satisfaction and 

customer loyalty of the performance of marketing 
organizations in the advertising sector industry in outdoor 

advertising media in Indonesia, so researchers are 

interested in conducting research on companies in the 
media sector industry. Outdoor advertising. Previous 

research has never been conducted in Indonesia, so 

researchers will conduct this research in Indonesia. Thus, 

in this research was conducted with the intention of 
identifying whether the application of customer loyalty 

and satisfaction can have a positive influence on the 

performance of advertising companies and improve the 
performance of marketing organizations. 

 

2. REVIEW OF THEORY 

A. Customer loyalty 
Loyalty is a psychological condition related to attitudes 

towards products. Consumers will form beliefs, determine 

likes and dislikes, and decide whether they want to buy 
products [21]. A customer loyalty is defined as purchases 

made routinely by several people [22]. A loyalty refers to 

things that are good for a brand and will further make 
consumers make repeat purchases [23]. Based on the 

above definition, it can be seen that loyalty is directed to 

the behavior shown by regular purchases based on 

decision making. Customers are considered loyal if they 
shop consistently at a certain place; this can be defined as 

a condition that requires the customer to make at least two 

purchases in a certain period of time. An explaining the 
indicators used in measuring customer loyalty, namely, 

repurchase, this is the customer's desire to use this service 

several times [24]. 

 
B. Customer satisfaction 

Customer satisfaction is related to evaluating a product or 

service, whether the product and service have met the 
needs and expectations of customers [25]. The definition 

of satisfaction refers to the approval or disappointment of 

a person when comparing their personal opinion with the 
services they receive [26]. Customer satisfaction assessed 

through the results of marketing activities and how the 

company gets success in offering quality products and 

services. Customer satisfaction comes from the 
physiology of how to respond to differences in the 

perception of the gap between expectations before and 

after customers consume a service or product. Customer 
satisfaction has been recognized as an important 

determinant of customer loyalty, providing satisfaction to 

customers is very important and is the key in creating 
customer loyalty because the company will get many 

benefits from achieving high levels of customer 

satisfaction [27]. 
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C. Marketing Organization Performance 

The results of the implementation of marketing strategies 

from companies to consumers, namely satisfaction, new 
product success, increased sales and profitability [28]. 

Thus, a profitability analysis is an assessment to review 

the effects of various marketing program strategies and 
their contribution to certain products [29]. The elements 

described to determine a marketing effectiveness model 

are marketing strategies and tactics such as programs. 
Loyalty, then customer impacts, such as customer 

awareness of the product, customer attitudes and 

customer experience and marketing assets such as brand 

equity and customer equity and also market impact 
namely customer loyalty and financial impact [30]. A 

marketing performance is the contribution of marketing 

strategy implementation and value creation to company 
profits as measured by sales of operating profit and 

market share [30]. 

 

D. Relationship between Customer Satisfaction and 
Customer Loyalty 

A satisfaction can be obtained from what consumers 

expect [31]. If the expectations are in accordance with 
what is desired, the customer will be satisfied, customer 

satisfaction is the foundation needed by a company to 

retain its customers [32]. A customer who are not 
satisfied with the services received will not be expected to 

have a long-term relationship with the company. 

Therefore, it is important for a company to be able to 

maintain customer satisfaction well, not only for new 
customers but customers who are already long time must 

also be maintained in order to maintain good loyalty with 

the company. A strong relationship between satisfaction 
and loyalty. Likewise, customer satisfaction and customer 

loyalty, is a positive relationship between satisfaction and 

loyalty [33]. Based on the results of previous research 
above, the authors propose a third hypothesis as follows: 

 

H1: Good customer satisfaction will increase customer 

loyalty 

 

E. Relationship between Customer Satisfaction and 

Marketing Organization Performance 
Based on research performance of marketing 

organizations is increased by customer satisfaction and 

loyalty. Companies that can respond to customer wants, 

and preferences will surely satisfy customers more than 
other companies, resulting in more successful business 

performance [33]. Customer satisfaction has been used as 

a performance measure in several studies to increased 
customer satisfaction can improve organizational 

performance in the long term. Some of the previous 

studies above prove that high customer satisfaction will 
lead to higher repurchase rates, customer retention, 

satisfaction and loyalty which lead to an increase in 

company revenue [34]. Based on the results of previous 

research above, the authors propose the fourth hypothesis 
as follows: 

H2: Good customer satisfaction will improve the 

performance of the marketing organization 

 
F. Relationship between Customer Loyalty and 

Marketing Organization Performance 

Customer loyalty is measured through the attitudes and 
behavior. In addition, loyalty reflects the psychological 

and emotional attachments that underlie the purchase 

motives and actions of a person in the future. true to a 
product is shown when individuals choose to remain 

company customers even when they are not offered the 

best quality products and services [34]. 

Customer loyalty can also be characterized by repeated 
purchases of a product or service then recommending it to 

others and defending it from bad comments and always 

supporting their choice. Based on previous research above, 
therefore the authors propose the fifth hypothesis as 

follows: 

 

H3: High customer loyalty will improve the performance 

of the marketing organization 

 

From the description above, the research model can be 
described in Figure 1. 

 

 
Figure 1. Thinking Framework 

 

G. Research Methods 

This study uses quantitative research methods, and 

researchers distribute a set of questionnaires to collect data 
from respondents. The data collected will be analyzed 

statistically using the SEM PLS software package, this 

study uses inferential statistical analysis methods to obtain 
the results to be studied, the analysis tool used in this 

study is the Likert scale using a ranking system where 

respondents will show how strongly they agree with a 

statement or disagree. The advertising company 
CityVision in Jakarta, Indonesia was chosen for the object 

of this research because the advertising media that City 

Vision currently has is a branding station and with the 
collaboration between private company PT KAI, 

CityVision has an exclusive contract to place 

advertisements on the Jabodetabek and National train 
stations in Indonesia. In addition, for other media, 

CityVision has media assets located in the premium area 

of Jabodetabek, including the Sudirman Central, Pondok 
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Indah, and Mega Kuningan areas. The subjects of this 

study consisted of City Vision consumers, namely 

employees of an advertising agency in Jakarta with a 
minimum position as a brand manager in the agency 

company, and a working period of more than five years in 

the advertising sector, with details of 17 media managers 
and 2 media directors from local agencies, 15 media 

managers and 3 media directors from multinational 

agencies, they became research subjects because they had 
experience in advertising spending activities. They are 

expected to be familiar with various advertising spending 

activities in City Vision and will help this research to find 

better service perceptions by City Vision, a total of 37 
survey forms were distributed. 

 

F. Measurement 
Measurements in this study on the customer loyalty 

variable with six statements, on the measurement of 

customer satisfaction variables and four statements, the 

last for the marketing organization performance variables 
with five statements [34, 35]. In this study the data 

obtained from distributing questionnaires were processed 

using a measurement scale with the Likert scale method. 
On the Likert scale, the method used uses five alternative 

answers, namely; a score of 5 highly agree (SS); a score of 

4 agreed assessment (S); score three assessment between 
agree and disagree; a score of 2 for assessment of disagree 

(TS) and a score of 1 for assessment of strongly disagree 

(STS). This study uses confirmatory factor analysis to test 

the validity by assessing the factor loading. The small 
factor loading value indicates that the factor analysis 

cannot be used, because the correlation between pairs of 

variables cannot be explained by other variables. If the 
factor loading value is below 0.5, then factor analysis 

cannot be used or accepted. At the same time, the 

acceptable factor loading value is with a minimum value 

limit of 0.5 [36, 37]. Reliability test with alpha Cronbach 
value 0.6-0.79, which means that reliability is accepted, 

whereas if the Cronbach alpha value is 0.8-1.0 then 

reliability is considered good [38, 39]. 
 

3. RESULTS AND DISCUSSION 

In this study, we use Structural Equation Modeling (SEM-
PLS) of Variable Customer Relationship Management 

(CRM), Customer Satisfaction, Customer Loyalty and 

Marketing Organization Performance to obtain the result. 

Here, the SEM-PLS was designed to obtain fit model with 
tested model from observation data (respondent). Figure 2 

shows SEM-PLS path diagram model in this study.  

 

 
 

Figure 2. SEM-PLS Model Path Diagram 

 
From the picture above, information is obtained that the 

model tested consists of 1 exogenous latel variable, 

namely Customer Relationship Management (CRM). And 

three endogenous latent variables, namely Customer 
Satisfaction (KP), Organizational Performance (KO) and 

Customer Loyalty (LP). Of all the types of variables and 

their dimensions will be tested using the SEM method 
using SmartPLS 3.0 software, as shown in the picture 

above. 

 
A. Outer Model Analysis 

Evaluation of the reflective indicator model includes 

examining: (1). individual item reliability, (2). internal 

consistency or construct reliability, and (3). the average 
variance extracted and (4)—discriminant validity. The first 

three measurements are categorized into convergent 

validity. 
 

B. Convergent Validity 

Convergent validity measures the amount of correlation 
between constructs and latent variables. In evaluating 

convergent validity from checking individual item 

reliability, it can be seen from the standardized loading 

factor value. Standardized loading factor describes the 
magnitude of the correlation between each measurement 

item (indicator) and its construct. The value of loading 

factor> 0.7 is said to be ideal, meaning that the indicator is 
said to be valid in measuring its construct. In empirical 

research experience, the loading factor value> 0.5 is still 

acceptable. Thus, the loading factor value <0.5 must be 

removed from the model (dropped). The square values of 
the loading factor values are called commonalities. This 

value shows the percentage of the construct that is able to 

explain the variation in the indicator (see Table I). 
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Table I. Summary of the Calculation Results of the 

Measurement Model Statistics 

 
 

From the results of the convergent validity (individual 

item reliability) analysis in the table above, it appears that 
all factor loading values of each indicator are> 0.5 so it 

can be concluded that there is no convergent validity 

(individual item reliability) problem in the model that was 

formed. After we evaluate the individual item reliability 
through the standardized loading factor value, the next 

step is to look at the internal consistency reliability of 

Cronbach's Alpha and Composite Reliability (CR) values. 
Composite Reliability (CR) is better at measuring internal 

consistency than Cronbach's Alpha in SEM because CR 

does not assume the same boot of each indicator. 
Cronbach's Alpha tends to underestimate construct 

reliability (internal consistency reliability) than Composite 

Reliability (CR). 

From the table above, it shows that the entire construct 
has a Cronbach's alpha value and composite reliability 

above 0.600. Therefore, there is no problem with 

convergent validity (internal consistency reliability) in the 
model that was formed. AVE value describes the amount 

of variance or variety of manifest variables that can be had 

by latent constructs. Thus, the greater the variance or 
variety of manifest variables that can be contained by the 

latent constructs, the greater the manifest variable 

representation of the latent constructs. AVE for a criterion 

in assessing convergent validity. A minimum AVE value of 
0.5 indicates a good measure of convergent validity. That 

is, the latent variable can explain an average of more than 

half the variance of the indicators. The AVE value 
obtained from the sum of the factor loading squares 

divided by the error. Apart from being seen from the 

loading factor value, convergent validity can also be seen 

from the average variance extracted (AVE) value. In this 
study, the AVE value of each construct was above 0.500. 

Therefore, there is no convergent validity problem 

(internal consistency reliability_AVE) in the model that is 
formed. 

 

 
 

C. Discriminant Validity 

Discriminant validity of the reflective model is evaluated 

through cross-loading, then the AVE value is compared 
with the square of the correlation value between constructs 

(or comparing the square root of AVE with the correlation 

between its constructs). The cross-loading measure is to 
compare the correlation of the indicator with its constructs 

and constructs from other blocks. If the correlation 

between the indicator and its construct is higher than the 
correlation with other block constructs, this shows that the 

construct predicts the size of their block better than other 

blocks. Another measure of discriminant validity is that 

the root AVE value must be higher than the correlation 
between constructs and other constructs or that the AVE 

value is higher than the square of the correlation between 

constructs. From the results of the cross loading analysis, 
it appears that there is no discriminant validity problem in 

the model formed (see Table II). 

 

Table II. Summary of Statistical Calculation Results 
Cross Loading 

 
From the table above, it can be seen that the square root 

value of AVE ("yellow" block) is greater than the 

correlation between constructs and other constructs. So it 
can be concluded that there is no problem of discriminant 

validity in the model formed. 

 
D. Hypothesis test 

Hypothesis testing is done by looking at the probability 

value and the t-statistic. For probability values, the p-value 

with α = 5% is less than 0.05. The t-table value for α = 5% 
is 1.96. So that the criteria for acceptance of the 

hypothesis is when the t-statistic (count)> t table (see 

Table III). 
 

Table III. Summary of Structural SEM Model 

Computation Results 
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From the table above, it can be explained that the 

estimation results of the effect of Customer Satisfaction 

(KP) on Customer Loyalty (LP) have a path coefficient of 
-0.285 and the effect is significant. This is evidenced by 

the t value obtained by Social Media Marketing 

Characteristics (KPMS) of 2.099 is greater than t table 
1.96. In addition, the p-value generated by customer 

loyalty of 0.036 is smaller than α = 5%. The estimation 

results of the effect of Customer Satisfaction (KP) on 
Organizational Performance (KO) have a path coefficient 

of 0.571. Where the influence is significant, this is 

evidenced by the t count, which obtained customer 

satisfaction of 2.836, greater than t table 1.96. Besides, the 
p-value generated by organizational performance is 0.005 

smaller than α = 5%. The estimation result of the effect of 

Customer Loyalty (LP) on Organizational Performance 
(KO) has a path coefficient of -0.087, and the effect is 

significant. This is evidenced by the t count which shows 

the organizational performance of 2.415 which is greater 

than t table 1.96 besides that the p-value generated by the 
organizational performance of 0.025 is smaller than α = 

5%. 

From the table above, it can be explained that the 
estimation results of the effect of Customer Satisfaction 

(KP) on Customer Loyalty (LP) have a path coefficient of 

-0.285 and the effect is significant. This is evidenced by 
the t value obtained by the Social Media Marketing 

Characteristics (KPMS) of 2.099 is greater than t table 

1.96. In addition, the p-value generated by customer 

loyalty of 0.036 is smaller than α = 5%. The estimation 
results of the effect of Customer Satisfaction (KP) on 

Organizational Performance (KO) have a path coefficient 

of 0.571. Where the influence is significant, this is 
evidenced by the t count which obtained customer 

satisfaction of 2.836, greater than t table 1.96. Besides, the 

p-value generated by organizational performance is 0.005 

smaller than α = 5%. And the estimation results of the 
effect of Customer Loyalty (LP) on Organizational 

Performance (KO) have a path coefficient of -0.087, and 

the effect is significant. This is evidenced by the t count, 
which shows the organizational performance of 2.415, 

which is greater than t table 1.96. In addition, the p-value 

generated by the organizational performance of 0.025 is 
smaller than α = 5%. 

From the table above, information is obtained as 

follows: The effect of customer satisfaction (KP) on 

customer loyalty (LP) is -0.285. It occurs from a direct 
effect and is stated to be significant based on the previous 

explanation. The effect of Customer Satisfaction (KP) on 

Marketing Organization Performance (KO) is 0.571 
(35.4%), which is a direct (35.5%) and indirect effect 

through the Customer Loyalty (LP) variable (0.1%) and is 

declared significant based on the previous explanation. 
The total effect of Customer Loyalty (LP) on Marketing 

Organization Performance (KO) is -0.087 (0.8%).  

 

 

All of them occur from a direct effect and are stated to be 

significant based on the previous explanation. In this study 

there are results that show that good customer satisfaction 
will improve the performance of marketing organizations. 

An effect of customer satisfaction on improving the 

performance of marketing organizations, in advertising in 
advertising companies there are many elements that need 

to be considered by the company in order to provide 

satisfaction for customers including product prices and 
product quality, with many competitors currently 

providing good price and quality. Considerations of 

advertisers to promote their products in the company, and 

if we can provide good results for advertisers, maintain, 
give trust to them when promoting their products, then 

when they need promotions for their products advertisers 

will not hesitate to use outside media space as a 
promotional medium for its products, in addition to this to 

be able to improve and maintain customer satisfaction, 

cooperation from various divisions in the company is 

needed, because customer satisfaction can not only be 
obtained if there is no good cooperation within the 

company. Therefore, there is a need for a system that both 

from each division that deals with direct consumers and 
the operational division in charge of ensuring all 

advertising products that are broadcast are of good quality 

and in accordance with the standards set by the company. 
For the results of the next study which states that 

customer satisfaction affects customer loyalty. With 

customer satisfaction that is well maintained, customer 

loyalty will be formed so that customers in this case 
outdoor advertising consumers will not hesitate to return 

to using the advertising media when necessary to carry out 

promotions. Therefore, it is very important for companies 
to always ensure that consumers are satisfied when 

advertising and that the results of ad serving are what 

consumers want. One of the effects that occur is because 

in the advertising sector, the products produced by 
advertising media are different and the opportunity for 

advertisers to use other media as an alternative to 

advertising is very high according to the needs of their 
products. Therefore, the media must be able to provide 

something different and exclusive so that it can increase 

customer loyalty. When compared to other media besides 
that a good advertising media must also be able to ensure 

that when consumers promote their products through these 

media, the goals that consumers want to achieve, namely 

advertisements promoted are known to the public, so that 
ultimately the media will become the choice of consumers 

when promoting their products. If consumers always use 

outdoor media as a promotional medium for advertising, 
the company's organizational performance will be 

maintained, and by maintaining the company's 

organizational performance, the company will continue to 
be able to compete with competitors. 
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4. CONCLUSIONS 

All hypotheses built in this study have been proven that 

there is a relationship between customer satisfaction and 
customer loyalty to the performance of the marketing 

organization. Customer satisfaction has a positive 

influence on the performance of the marketing 
organization as the first hypothesis of this study. The better 

customer satisfaction is implemented which affects the 

satisfaction of advertisers, the better the performance of 
marketing organizations in outdoor media advertising 

companies will be increased. 

Then based on this research, the effect of customer 

satisfaction is also significant on customer loyalty. 
Therefore the company must be able to provide customer 

satisfaction to customers in order to create good loyalty so 

that customers do not hesitate to entrust product promotion 
through outdoor media advertising companies, with the 

creation of customer loyalty. Well, customers will 

increasingly use outdoor media as a means of promoting 

their products, and this based on the following research 
will further improve the performance of marketing 

organizations in outdoor advertising companies. 

 
References  
[1] Ahluwalia, R., Burnkrant, R. E., & Unnava, H. R. (2000). Consumer 

Response to Negative Publicity: The Moderating Role of Commitment. 

Journal of Marketing Research, 37(2), 203–214. 

https://doi.org/10.1509/jmkr.37.2.203.18734 

[2] Akbar, M. M., & Parvez, N. (2009). Impact Service Quality, Trust, and 

Customer Satisfaction on Customers Loyalty. ABAC Journal, 29(1), 24–

38. 

[3] Akhter, W., Abbasi, A. S., Ali, I., & Afzal, H. (2011). Factors Affecting 

Customer Loyalty in Pakistan.African Journal of Business Management, 

5(4), 1167–1174. https://doi.org/10.5897/AJBM10.501 

[4] Akroush, M. N., Dahiyat, S. E., Gharaibeh, H. S., & Abu-Lail, B. N. 

(2011). Customer Relationship Management Implementation: an 

investigation of a scale’s generalizability and its relationship with business 

performance in a developing country context. International Journal of 

Commerce and Management, 21(2), 158–191. 

https://doi.org/10.1108/10569211111144355 

[5] Al-Tit, A. A. (2015). The effect of service and food quality on customer 

satisfaction and hence customer retention. Asian Social Science, 11(23), 

129–139. https://doi.org/10.5539/ass.v11n23p129 

[6] Algesheimer, R., Dholakia, U. M., & Herrmann, A. (2005). The social 

influence of brand community: Evidence from European car clubs. Journal 

of Marketing, 69(3), 19–34. https://doi.org/10.1509/jmkg.69.3.19.66363 

[7] Amir, M., Yousof, H., & Asma, E. (2014). The Effect Of Using Customer 

Relationship Management System On Customer Loyalty Case Study: 

Ansar Bank’s Branches In East Azarbaijan. Indian J.Sci.Res, 8(1), 98–106. 

[8] Auh, S., & Johnson, M. D. (2005). Compatibility Effects in Evaluations of 

Satisfaction and Loyalty.Journal of Economic Psychology, 26(1), 35–57. 

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.joep.2003.10.002 

[9] Bennett, R., & Rundle-Thiele, S. (2002). A comparison of attitudinal 

loyalty measurement approaches.Journal of Brand Management, 9(3), 193–

209. https://doi.org/10.1057/palgrave.bm.2540069 

[10] Bodet, G. (2008). Customer Satisfaction and Loyalty in Service: Two 

Concepts, Four Constructs, Several Relationships. Journal of Retailing and 

Consumer Services, 15(3), 156–162. 

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jretconser.2007.11.004 

[11] Eren, S. S., Eren, M. Ş., Ayas, N., & Hacioglu, G. (2013). The Effect of 

Service Orientation on Financial Performance: The Mediating Role of Job 

Satisfaction and Customer Satisfaction. Procedia - Social and Behavioral 

Sciences, 99, 665–672. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.sbspro.2013.10.537 

[12] Farida, N., & Ardyan, E. (2018). The Driving of Customer Loyalty: 

Relational Approach, Perceived Value and Corporate Image. International 

Journal of Business and Society, 19(1), 15–26. 

[13] Fasi, M., & Begum, S. (2017). Impact of Outdoor Advertising in Building 

Brands - a Study of.International Journal on Customer Relations, 5(2), 

34892.Gao, Y. (2010). Measuring marketing performance: a review and a 

framework. The Marketing Review, 10(1), 25–40. 

https://doi.org/10.1362/146934710x488924 

[14] Gerpott, T. J., Rams, W., & Schindler, A. (2001). Customer Retention, 

Loyalty, and Satisfaction in the German Mobile Cellular 

Telecommunications Market. Telecommunications Policy, 25(4), 249–269. 

https://doi.org/10.1016/S0308-5961(00)00097-5 

[15] Hon Liung, H. L., & Rahmat Syah, T. (2017). Pengaruh Kualitas Layanan 

Terhadap Kepuasan Dalam Meningkatkan Loyalitas Di Moderasi Harga. 

Jurnal Ekonomi Universitas Esa Unggul, 8(01). 

[16] Johnson, J. L., & Raven, P. V. (1996). Relationship quality, satisfaction 

and performance in export marketing channels. Journal of Marketing 

Channels, 5(3–4), 19–48. https://doi.org/10.1300/J049v05n03_02 

[17] Kafko, D. (2017). Effect of Customer Relationship Management on 

Marketing Performance of Commercial Banks in Kenya. 

[18] Kashani, F. H., & Moradi, Z. (2015). Perceived Value , Corporate Image 

and Customer Loyalty : the Moderation Role of Relationship Length. 

Indian Journal Of Fundamental and Applied Life Science, 5, 1801–1811. 

[19] Keiningham, T. L., Cooil, B., Aksoy, L., Andreassen, T. W., & Weiner, J. 

(2007). The Value of Different Customer Satisfaction and Loyalty Metrics 

in Predicting Business Performance. Managing Service Quality: An 

International Journal, 17(4), 361–384. 

https://doi.org/10.1108/09604520710760526 

[20] Keisidou, E., Sarigiannidis, L., Maditinos, D. I., & Thalassinos, E. I. 

(2013). Customer satisfaction, Loyalty and Financial Performance: A 

Holistic Approach of the Greek Banking Sector.International Journal of 

Bank Marketing, 31(4), 259–288. https://doi.org/10.1108/IJBM-11-2012- 

0114 

[21] Keller, K. L. (2007). Marketing Management. (October), 1–5. Retrieved 

from http://books.google.cz/books?id=pkWsyjLsfGgCKhan, I. (2012). 

Impact of Customer Satisfaction and Retention on Customer Loyalty. 

International Journal of Scientific & Technology Research, 1(2), 106–110. 

[22] Khedkar, E. B. (2015). Analysis of Customer Satisfaction during Online 

Purchase. International Journal of Research in Finance and Marketing, 

5(5), 1–7. 

[23] Koh, C. E. (2009). The Impact of it Capability on Employee Capability, 

Customer Value, Customer Satisfaction, and Business Performance. 

[24] Kulsum, U., & Syah, T. Y. R. (2017). The Effect of Service Quality on 

Loyalty with Mediation of Patient Satisfaction. International Journal of 

Business and Management Invention ISSN, 6(3), 41–50.Retrieved from 

www.ijbmi.org 

[25] Lee, Y. K., Park, D. H., & Yoo, D. K. (1999). The Structural Relationships 

Between Service Orientation, Mediators, and Business Performance in 

Korean Hotel Firms. Asia Pacific Journal of Tourism Research, 4(1), 59–

70. https://doi.org/10.1080/10941669908722031 

[26] Li, S., Ragu-Nathan, B., Ragu-Nathan, T. S., & Subba Rao, S. (2006). The 

impact of supply chain management practices on competitive advantage 

and organizational performance. Omega, 34(2), 107–124. 

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.omega.2004.08.002 

[27] Long, C. S., Khalafinezhad, R., Ismail, W. K. W., & Rasid, S. Z. A. (2013). 

Impact of CRM Factors on Customer Satisfaction and Loyalty. Asian 

Social Science, 9(10), 247–253. https://doi.org/10.5539/ass.v9n10p247 

[28] Morgan, N. a. (2014). The Value of Different Costumer Satisfaction and 

Loyalty Metrics in Predicting Business Performance. Marketing Science, 

25(5), 426–439. https://doi.org/10.1287/mksc.l050.0180News, D. M., 

Herald, M., Star, K. C., Reports, B., Advantage, T. S., Magazine, I., … 

Business, N. (2002).Customer Loyalty : How to Earn It , How to Keep It. 

Jossey - Bass. 

[29] Nwokah, N. G. (2015). Customer Relationship Management and Marketing 

Performance : The Study of Food and Beverages Firms in Nigeria 

Customer Relationship Management and Marketing Performance : The 

Study of Food and Beverages Firms in Nigeria. European Journal of 

Business and Management, 7(15). 

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jretconser.2007.11.004


 

      RESEARCH ARTICLE                                            Journal of Multidisciplinary Academic 
 

241                                                   
                                   JoMA, Vol. 04, No. 04, 2020                            No.0209/2020/09                                 

Content from this work may be used under the terms  
of the Creative Commons Attribution 3.0 license. 

[30] Rahmat Syah, T. (2013). Perbedaan Pengaruh Citra Merek dan Reputasi 

Perusahaan Terhadap Kualitas Produk, Nilai Pelanggan dan Loyalitas 

Pelanggan di Pasar Bisnis. Jurnal Ekonomi, 4(2). 

[31] Ranabhat, D. (2018). Customer Loyalty in Business. Centria University of 

Applied Science, (March), 33+3. Retrieved from 

https://www.theseus.fi/bitstream/handle/10024/142883/ 

[32] RanabhatDurga.pdf?sequence=1&isAllowed=yRossomme, J. (2003). 

Customer satisfaction measurement in a business-to-business context: A 

conceptual framework. Journal of Business and Industrial Marketing, 

18(2–3), 179–195. https://doi.org/10.1108/08858620310463097 

[33] Saunders, M., Lewis, P., & Thornhill, A. (2009). Research Method for 

Business Students. Prentice Hall, 5. 

[34] Shankar, V., Smith, A. K., & Rangaswamy, A. (2003). Customer 

satisfaction and loyalty in online and offline environments. International 

Journal of Research in Marketing, 20(2), 153–175. 

https://doi.org/10.1016/S0167-8116(03)00016-8 

[35] Slater, S. F., & Narver, J. C. (2000). Intelligence Generation and Superior 

Customer Value. Journal of the Academy of Marketing Science, 28(1), 

120–127. https://doi.org/10.1177/0092070300281011 

[36] Smith, R. E., & Wright, W. F. (2004). Determinants of Customer Loyalty 

and Financial Performance.Journal of Management Accounting Research, 

16(1), 183–205. https://doi.org/10.2308/jmar.2004.16.1.183 

[37] Syahfudin, E., & Ruswanti, E. (2009). The Impact of Service Quality and 

Brand Image on Customer Loyalty Mediated by Customer Satisfaction : in 

Indonesia Banking Industry Bank BNI BRI  Danamon Bukopin 

Commonwealth CIMB Niaga Bank BNI Commonwealth Danamon 

Permata BTN. 

[38] Zuhdi, S. (2017). Pengaruh Kualitas Produk Dan Desain Produk Terhadap 

Keputusan Pembelian. Bisma: Jurnal Manajemen, 5(1), 26–33. 

[39] Zuhri, M. A. T., & Palupiningdyah. (2018). The Influence of Customer 

Relationship Management and Brand Image on Customer Loyalty Through 

Satisfaction. Management Analysis Journal, 

 

Received: 20 June 2020, Accepted: 31 August 2020 

 

 

 


